
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: 
Date: Wed, 19 May 2010 13:25:25 +0000 

yes 

On Wed, May 19, 2010 at 9:17 AM, Rich Kahn

Confirming that lam paying 133,519.96 (march 58,250 and april 75,269.96) 

Rich Kahn 

> wrote: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com 
Sent: Wednesday, May 19, 2010 5:17 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: 

pay weinberg bills 
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