
From: Richard Kahn 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Russell 
Date: Thu, 08 Feb 2018 18:17:39 +0000 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 212-320-0381 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Russell Hernandez 
Subject: Re: LSJ 
Date: February 8, 2018 at 1:01:13 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Harvey Bloomston 

Hi Richard 

The Day rate is ok if they are sending 3 mechanics the question is do they need 3 days 

We have sourced the wood flooring material for the MBR, and speed waterproofing detail 

We have sourced the palm trees and the transport and a way to plant them 

We have been reviewing the clean up and maintenance Brice has been doing 

We have been interviewing architects 

I can list more stuff but this a quick summary 

I have Harvey that can update you on the payment 

Thank you 

Russell Hernandez 

EFTA00891007



On Feb 8, 2018, at 12:37 PM, Richard Kahn •c: Ila wrote: 

please confirm your received 35,000 i sent this week 
what have you been doing regarding LSJ as i have not yet seen anything. 
additionally quote below of 9848 seems a bit excessive to do inspection on 2 generators 
please advise 
thank you 

<EPG-18-519 LittleStJames-inspection.pdf> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 212-320-0381 
cell 917-414-7584 

EFTA00891008


