From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationf@gmail.com>

To: Mark Fisher <
Subject: Re:
Date: Sun, 06 Jun 2010 21:45:26 +0000

15 the idea to evalutate it and pay this money back, 1 just want to be clear.

On Sun, Jun 6, 2010 at 5:43 PM, Mark Fisher _ wrote:

Jeffrey

How are you?

The therapy seems to be working. The doc has also been upping the doses.
Side effects are what they are. If you need some fuel for your jet Ive got
extra gas.

The storage facility called me last week to ask 1f | am going forward with
the deal they agreed to. | am attaching a previous email below regarding
the artwork. On that note, the values for Basquiat works on paper were
very good during the spring auctions.

Please let me know. The storage warehouse told me to pay or the deal 15
off the table.

Thank you for being you.

All the best,

Mark

ARTWORK STORAGE INFO
The Storage facility will give a year of future storage (value $2800)and
payoff of $ 6300 owed for a single payment of $ 7000. (Savings $2100)
Photography costs for slides for Authentication Committee $2700.
Application fee for Authentication Committee $ 1800 (5100 per work X 18)

Total $11,500
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(agmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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