From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
To: Larry Visoski {_3
Subject: Re: LED update
Date: Thu, 28 Jun 2018 21:43:24 +0000

Have rich get the real price

On Thu, Jun 28, 2018 at 5:25 PM Larry Visoski - wrote:
Jeffrey
Pete spoke with ALL aircraft highting International
Same company Eric uses for LED lights,

According to sales person, no potentiometers are required in the LED system light change,
From Pete;

Hi Larry,

i spoke to Shervin today-

There are no potentiometer or other components required.

Each of the 4 existing power supplies are replaced. Minor change in pinouts for plugs.
Bulbs are plug in, mount brackets (included) may have to be replaced due to
difference in bulb diameter.

System is PMA Approved. no need for additional FAA documentation.

It would take 3 to 4 business days to assemble components after order is placed.

He estimates 2 to 3 days for the installation which could be done at TEB.

Would the arrival on the 8th leave us time before next trip?
If so, need to place order soon-

Regards,
Pete

Sent from My J-Pad
Begin forwarded message:
From: Shervin Rezaie <{| R

Date: June 28, 2018 at 3:57:45 PM EDT

To: Pete Rawson <_}

Subject: Re: Scanned from Meridian Hangar 107

Hi Pete,

Great speaking with you today. Below you'll find the quote updated. If you need anything else please do not
hesitate to call me.

Thanks,

EFTA00894830



Shervin

ORIGINAL QUANTI

PNS ALIPN TY Cost Each  |TOTAL

5800-300-

252000 L5800-300-45 18 $851.00 $15,318.00

5800-105-

252000 L5800-105-45 3 $400.00 $1,200.00

Sisyindiezale

252000 L5800-285-45 24 $851.00 $20,424.00
fugoRhs s $400.00  |$3,200.00
N O 4 $700.00 $2,800.00

Grand Total $42.942.00

e

Sent from my 1Phone
please note

The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA00894831



