
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Fri, 19 Nov 2010 17:09:12 +0000 

yes„ i am very annoyed 

On Fri, Nov 19, 2010 at 11:52 AM wrote: 
Leah says that she would like me to tell you that she is giving you the stuff and you'll have a small balance that 
you can take care of next time you come in. ( meaning the additional 2000 for the bronze men which makes 
them 7000 instead of 5000) . May I go ahead and pay. We will be able to collect the lamps on Monday she 
says. 

Sent from my iPhone 
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