
From: Cecile de Jongh
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
Cc: Richard Kahn < >, ann rodriquez 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 26 Jun 2018 09:18:23 +0000 

Ok re VIVA. 

Re Sylvester- we tried to get other people not associated with LSJ, but the job is deemed too small for anyone to 
bother, I'll try again. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone. 

On Jun 26, 2018, at 5:08 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

pay them . please have another contractor fix . no reason to rely on sylvester alone 

On Tue, Jun 26, 2018 at 12:47 AM, Cecile de Jongh < > wrote: 
Baseboards: will be installed Friday/Saturday. Sylvester began fabricating them and then told Anna that he 
needed another bit. Anna ordered it and it should be here by Thursday/Friday. 

VIVA- met with them (VIVA contractors) last week. They are insisting that we need to pay them $12K to 
hook LSJ back up. I checked with friends inside VIYA and they are telling me not to pay but I can't let the 
contractors know that we are speaking. My next step is to talk to a friend at the PSC (Public Services 
Commission) and get a read on what he thinks. At any rate, VIVA is saying 30-45 days out from the time that 
we pay them. Do you want me to continue to fight the $12K upfront fee? 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone. 

On Jun 25, 2018, at 4:23 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

are the baseboards all installed .? status of viya 
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