
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: The Duke

Subject: Re: Fw: Latest Update from John O'Sullivan 
Date: Tue, 04 Jan 2011 11:03:43 +0000 

i understand.. We should speak, 

On Tue, Jan 4, 2011 at 3:15 AM, The Duke < > wrote: 

To be fair to S on this occasion. He sent her a charming Christmas Card (quite unlike the 
hassle he has been causing over the past few months) and S asked if she should respond I said 
my usual it is better to keep your enemies close so she did. He then responded with the fact 
that he was in touch with you and that things were progressing. I then told her to tell him that 
if that was the case then he should ring Amanda to tell her that he was in a position to accept 
my deal and that anything else would follow as soon as possible. That's it. 

From his email to you he says he'll ring which is what I want him to do in the first 
instance because this then gets him in line with all the others wh have agreed with my offer. 
From my understanding of the facts once he confirms with that he will accept, then 
25% of the $130k will be paid over immediately, as it is ready in the queue to go. ALL the 
others are now paid. 

What happens next is to sort out the rest and that, because of my legal position, has to be done 
between you and he, of course with my help but NOT S's. 

From the signature to my deal going forward I hope that S will never speak to him again. 
However I'm not sure that will happen. 

Hope this placates your ire. Sorry it happened again but there are extenuating circumstances. 

A 

HRH The Duke of York KG 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailtojeevacationtegmail cam 
Sent: 04 January 2011 00:15 
To: The Duke 
Subject: Fwd: Fw: Latest Update from John O'Sullivan 

EFTA00901326



im not sure why anyone else would talk to him, I m not sure why this keeps happening 

 Forwarded message  
From: 
Date: Mon, Jan 3, 2011 at 6:14 PM 
Subject: Fw: Latest Update from John O'Sullivan 
To: jee loki@gmail.com

 Original Message 
From: n c'os 
To: 
Sent: Mon Jan 03 17:57:05 2011 
Subject: Latest Update from John O'Sullivan 

<<John_O'Sullivan_SummaryofPayments.xls>> 
Dear Mr Epstein, 

I just spoke to and said that I'd drop you an email with the latest news. I heard from the Duchess a few 
times over the weekend, and she indicated that a payment directly to Columbia University for $59,932.80 to 
cover my student debts and a separate payment to me for $54,126 to pay back my own cash was acceptable to 
the Duke. The Duchess added that the Duke would like me to call Amanda Thirsk to let her know that I am 
now in a position to be able to accept PWC's offer, which I'll do tomorrow once she's back in the office. 

To help the process along, I have prepared a simple payment summary based on the assumption that PWC will 
be paying 25% of the original $126,722 owed to me. I have included my bank account details and a link 
detailing how to make payments to Columbia University. 

Please let me know if there is anything else you'd like me to send through to you at this point. 

With my thanks and best wishes, 

Johnny 

John O'Sullivan 

SUMMARY OF PAYMENTS 

Johnny's cash $54,126 
Johnny's unpaid wages $72,596 
Original amount owed to Johnny: $126,722 

25% of original amount owed to Johnny (to be paid by PWC as part of settlement): 
Payment to be made to Columbia University to cover Johnny's tuition*: $59,933 
Payment balance due Johnny (Johnny's cash minus PWC payment)**: $22,446 

$31,681 
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Total payments to be made: $114,059 

*Link to Columbia University's student payment site: 
httplAvww.columbia.edu/cu/sfs/docs/billing/payment-options.html?en= 
<http://www.columbia.edu/cu/sfs/docs/billing/payment-options.html?en=> 

**John O'Sullivan's bank details: 
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