
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: shutters 

Date: Tue, 01 Feb 2011 22:18:34 +0000 

ok to pay 

On Tue, Feb 1, 2011 at 4:21 PM, Rich Kahn

Just wanted to verify no approved means this is ok to pay? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

> wrote: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com 
Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 9:43 AM 
To: Gary Kerney 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: shutters 

no approved 

On Tue, Feb 1, 2011 at 9:42 AM, Gary Kerney < 

Jeffrey 

wrote: 

Rich is holding the deposit to Accent windows order for the shutters on cottages and kitchen of $21,295 

I showed you the bid and you approved it I/13/11 

did you change your mind? 

if not should we add shutters for the doors in the master bedroom foyer ? 
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