From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(wgmail.com=
To: Emad Hanna {_='
Subject: Re: Flagpole/Pool
Date: Wed, 02 Feb 2011 20:26:17 +0000

ok

On Wed, Feb 2, 2011 at 3:21 PM, Emad Hanna *’4_ wrote:

leffrey,

[ had Gary give me the details of Glidden’s quote of § 23,750 for the new electrical work by the Flagpole/Pool
area. | had these prices checked out and it turns out that they are actually very good.

There is no budget for this project as of yet and I need your approval to send Glidden $ 12,500 for the 1
payment on this contract.

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller
HERK Associates
38l East 66th 5t
Suite 18F

New York, NY 18865

cell
Ls1 office |

5t. Thomas Office
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Fax
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confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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