
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: paul krassner 

Subject: Re: FYI 
Date: Sat, 27 Jan 2018 01:45:08 +0000 

Inline-Images: 

you are welcome. . 

On Sat, Jan 27, 2018 at 2:23 AM, paul krassner > wrote: 

This (gulp) will be my last query about our contract. 

The contract states that I would receive $25,000 in 2017. But I received $20,000. 

I appreciated receiving that retroactive $5000 check today. 

Also, "The term of this Agreement shall commence on February 1, 2017 and shall expire on January 31, 
2018" 

Doesn't that mean I should receive a final $5000 check during the month of January 31, 2018? 

Oh, well, in any case, below is a couple of placards . . . 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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