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See you then A 

Deepak Chopra MD 

Chopra Foundation 
Ayl 
Chopra Center for Wellbeing 
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On Jan 27, 2018, at 1:38 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes great 

On Sat, Jan 27, 2018 at 10:22 AM Deepak Chopra 
I can come at 6 PM 
Have dinner meeting 7 PM 
Let me know 

Deepak Chopra MD 

cnopra Foundation 
Jiyo 
Chopra (Tenter for Wellbeing 
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wrote: 
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On Jan 27, 2018, at 6:00 AM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Can we do 6 instead bad weather 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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