From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(wgmail.com=
To: Emad Hanna ~_«
Subject: Re: LS New Pool
Date: Tue, 22 Feb 2011 19:52:34 +0000

don[t we have a truck what does that mean per day

On Tue, Feb 22, 2011 at 2:50 PM, Emad Hanna w_ wrote:

[ts 20 trips using Dream Trucking at a set rate of § 250 + 5 20 Port fee totaling 5 270 per trip

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller

HERK Associates

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation(i gmail.com ]
Sent: Tuesday, February 22, 2011 2:40 PM

To: Emad Hanna

Subject: Re: LS] New Pool
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details of trucking?
On Tue, Feb 22, 2011 at 12:38 PM, Emad Hanna <[ | R - o
leffrey,

I have a request for 500 tons of Colombian Sand for § 35,000 and trucking 15 § 5,400

Total 15 3 40,400

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller

HERK Associates

The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is tended only for
the use of the addressee. [t 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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