From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(wgmail.com=

To: Emad Hanna <
Subject: Re: L8] Main House Pool
Date: Wed, 09 Mar 2011 17:27:21 +0000

ok

On Wed, Mar 9, 2011 at 9:23 AM, Emad Hanna *_'—'-* wrote:

leffrey,

I received a request to pay a deposit of 5 20,000 on a § 100,000 for the pool for the above project which has no
budget

So far on this project expenditures are at § 103,750

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller

HBRK Associates

New York, NY 18865

EFTA00905846



EE R S b st b S
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA00905847



