
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "'Jeffrey Epstein" <jeeyacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: 

Date: Mon, 14 Mar 2011 15:03:29 +0000 

Are you ok if l give her wire instructions? 

From: 
Sent: Monday, March 14, 2011 11:02 AM 
To: 
Subject: Re: 

Hi -
Yes, the funds for the deposit will be released this month. 
Please advise on how the money is best repaid - wire, cash, check, etc. 

Thank you again, 

 Original Message 
From: Rich Kahn 
To: 
Sent: Fri, Mar 11, 2011 4:39 pm 

Just wanted to follow up on our last conversation regarding money due to Jeffrey Epstein. 
I believe you said repayment would be in March 

Please call me with any questions 

Thank you 

Rich Kahn 

EFTA00906291


