
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Fri, 11 Mar 2011 20:47:24 +0000 

call me 505 938 2929 

On Fri, Mar 11, 2011 at 12:43 PM, wrote: 
Hello 
Just arrived in Vienna 

The license is active 
license number 

For the taxes, it was a payment due last year that has been done. I will get more details on it. It was the 
payment that we had to do urgently in december. I also know that we are in negotiation with IRS for one 
previous year that still have to be paid 
I am having diner with Adam wife 8 month pregnant and mother. 
Stay safe 
Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 
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