
From: emad hanna
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: Rich Kahn < >, Brice Gordon

Subject: Fwd: Lull Parts 
Date: Wed, 04 May 2011 20:42:00 +0000 

Attachments: SICMBT_C25311050316430.pdf 

Jeffrey, 

Brice just inquired about the payment that we are still holding and said that you approved it. 

He is requesting we process this check 

Please advise 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: emad hanna < 
Date: May 3, 2011 5:03:25 PM EDT 
To: JE Credit Card <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: Rich Kahn <  >, Darren Indyke < 
Subject: Lull Parts 

Jeffrey, 

I received the quote from Jack at American Export and there were two lines that had bad part numbers so he 
could not price them so I just added them in so we can fully compare the prices. 

Please see the attached and if this was an emergency we estimated FedEx over night to be $800 due to the 
weight of the items 

The material cost difference is less by $4,591.68 so even if we FedEx them the savings would be $3,791.68 

We have not signed the check and still holding it 

Please advise 

EFTA00910113


