From: Richard Kahn _}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: PBI Network Upgrade Option
Date: Tue, 16 Jan 2018 22:49:53 +0000
Attachments: Epstein_Residence Ruckus Network.pdf
Inline-Images: image001.jpg; image002.gif; image003.png

attached is proposal from ETC for Network to move to Ruckus Wireless in the amount of 26,865.23

equipment lead time 15 2 weeks so approx 3 weeks from time we approve

ETC said they would try to do a quick repair while we waited

also need clarification on interior vs exterior access points as quote does not give details

1 think quote is 20-25% inflated and it also includes 1145 for monitoring system which 1 am not sure you want..

please advise
a) obtain another quote from FL vendor
b) run numbers by Al and have him quote based on ETC pro forma (issue is on service if we use NYC vendor)

¢) negotiate and sign up ETC asap

please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

=

From: Bella Klein =<
Subject: Re: NETWORK

Date: January 16, 2018 at 4:18:11 PM EST
To: Fred Ogg =

Cc: Richard Kahn <

Very good! can you please let us know how many points inside main house and outside.
Thank vou,
Bella

Tel:

EFTA00911053



On Jan 16, 2018, at 4:13 PM, Fred Ogg q~—> wrote:

Bella,
The guys said we'd definitely try to do a quick repair once it's approved while we wait on the rest.

They said that there are approximately nine access points on the property, so we are replacing all of them. If we find
that we can get away with less, we will credit the one or two we don't use.

Regards,

Fred Ogg
ETC

ce! I

Begin forwarded message:

From: Bella Klein <||lIGIGINININGE-
Subject: Fwd: Network Upgrade Option
Date: January 16, 2018 at 3:45:14 PM EST

To: Richard Kahn <| I -

Quote for PB Network is attached

Thank vyou,
Bella

Tel:

Begin forwarded message:

From: Fred Ogg <

Subject: RE: Network Upgrade Option
Date: January 16, 2018 at 3:33:11 PM EST
To: Bella Klein >

Good afternoon,

I've attached our recommendation for the network upgrade. Mormally, it takes about two weeks to get all of the
material, then the installation will follow shortly after.

We'd need the down payment before we can order anything. | can pickup a check, we can arrange a wire transfer, or
we do take credit cards but there is a 3% service fee. Let me know what works best for you.

Let me know if you have any questions.

EFTA00911054



Regards,

Fred Ogg
ETC

From: Bella Klein [mailto:

Sent: Tuesday, January 16, 2018 12:35 PM
To: Fred Ogg

Cc: Charlie Teran; Lorenz Go

Subject: Re: Network Upgrade Option

Great

Thank vou,
Bella

Tel:

On Jan 16, 2018, at 12:33 PM, Fred Ogg <|| - v rote:

Bella,

Thank you for calling. We are putting together the recommended network design, [ will forward 1t to you by

email as soon as it's done.

Regards,

EFTA00911055



Fred Oﬁﬁ
wesl Palm Beach, FL 33407

I Falm B

EFTA00911056



