
From: "George Reenstra"

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com>, "lvjet" < 

Cc: "Richard Kahn" < 

Subject: RE: 

Date: Thu, 09 Jun 2011 21:26:24 +0000 

Yes on the numbers and yes we split the profit on 472 however I do get my 100k for the sale of 750 
above the 472 profit split at the closing of 750 

George Reenstra 
Aircraft Services Group Inc 
212 Route 94, Ste 2E 
Vernon, NJ 07462 
Tel 
Fa 
Website: 
Email: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mallto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Thursday, June 09, 2011 2:49 PM 
To: Ivjet; George Reenstra 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: 

the deal george and i agreed, he now needs to go to aetvna. 11 .9 for 750 1.5 for 472.. profit after all costs will 
be split 50/50 on the sale .. with george. 
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