
From: Jeffrey <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Fwd: Signed LOI 

Date: Tue, 28 Jun 2011 19:24:00 +0000 

Ok 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "George Reenstra"  
Date: June 28, 2011 2:57:53 PM EDT 
To: "Richard Kahn" 
Cc: <1. >, "Darren Indyke" 
Subject: RE: Signed LOI 

, "Jeffrey " <jeevacationggmail.com>

Here is the wire info for the 100k as spelled out in the LOI 

Please reference the serial number 760472 registered N162AE 

Let me know when the transfer has been sent so I can inform Aetna 

George Reenstra 
Aircraft Services Group Inc 
212 Route 94, Ste 2E 
Vernon, NJ 07462 
Tel 'ext. 100 
Fax 
Website: www.yourjet.com 
Email: georgt@yourjet.com 

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, June 28, 2011 2:37 PM 
To: Larry Visoski; Darren Indyke 
Cc: George Reenstra 
Subject: re: Signed LOI 

Attached is signed LOI 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

EFTA00914169



From: 
Date: June 28, 2011 3:22:51 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 
Reply-To: 

<Insured Aircraft Title Service Wiring Details.pdf> 

EFTA00914170


