
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: 3771 
Date: Mon, 22 Aug 2011 18:15:34 +0000 

100k 

On Mon, Aug 22, 2011 at 8:08 PM, Richard Kahn
I am ready to send 100k to Roy & Scott as you requested 
I informed Scott that i was out on Friday and they said ok if i send today 

> wrote: 

I want to be clear regarding your not to exceed request. 
Is it 100k (or another number) just for motion papers or everything else they are working on? 

Should I communicate via email or phone? 

Please advise. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-4811 
fax 646-350-0954 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Scott Kornspan"  
Date: August 19, 2011 10:11:40 AM EDT 
To: "Richard Kahn" 
Cc: "Dee Craig" 
Subject: Re: 3771 

Yes. Have a nice weekend. 

>>> Richard Kahn < 
I am out of the office today 
Is It ok if I send funds Monday? 

From: Scott Kornspan 
Date: Fri, 19 Aug 2011 09:37:25 -0400 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 3771 

> 8/19/2011 10:08 AM >» 

c M• , Dee Craig 

Dee, please provide Richard our firm's trust account wire information. 

>>> Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationragmail.com> 8/19/2011 9:35 AM >>> 
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ok, 

On Thu, Aug 18, 2011 at 3:07 AM, Scott Kornspan < > wrote: 
Not sure what you mean Jeffrey by "fix the fees"? Fees are a direct result of the amount of time spent and I am not 
sure there really is any way to truly calculate what the amount of time spent will be. Too much uncertainty on this 
one and some of which is out of our control. We will, of course, do everything in our power to be as efficient as 
possible. 
I suspect that come the end of August our time/fees from August (hearing and prep and now the additional briefing 
etc) will exceed the approximately $100,000 which is currently in your trust account. Please send another $100,000 
to our firm's trust account now which I certainly hope will cover all the work related to the Judge's briefing schedule 
and the papers required for your Motion to Intervene and leave some leftover as this 3771 matter continues. 
Feel free to call me if you want to discuss further. 
Best, 
Scott 
>>> Jeffrey Epstein 08/17/11 3:00 PM >>> 
i appreciate the heads up, lets go ahead, lets fix the fees lets also reintroduce you into the state matter which you 
spent so much time getting up to speed on 

On Wed, Aug 17, 2011 at 2:23 AM, Roy BLACK < > wrote: 
Jeffrey: we did not have a full discussion after the hearing about our strategy going forward. I did mention my 
fears about what could happen and that you should intervene to protect your privileges. 
Scott has asked me to write to you to get your thoughts on this. Jeffrey, you will recall when you, me and Scott 
spoke back in middle July we said that we felt comfortable that the then roughly $100,000 that would be left in 
trust after the outstanding balance through June 30, 2011 was paid, would be sufficient to cover the preparation 
for and attendance at the hearing. We were right and it was. 

As we told you in that call if after the hearing it required additional briefing for the Judge that the legal fees could 
certainly exceed the amount in trust. You understood and we agreed that we would communicate further with you 
in advance if we thought the circumstances were such that we would exceed the trust remainder. With the Judge's 
briefing schedule which requires us to file first and then file a reply plus you now intervening and us having to do 
that work too, there is no doubt that we will well exceed what we currently have in trust. I tell you this now so 
that we don't have the same problems we had back in June and July. 

If for some reason you don't want us to handle the initial post-hearing filing, the reply or the additional work 
related to your intervention, please let us know immediately as the deadllines are approaching and you should 
then have someone else do it. If you understand that our work has now significantly increased following the 
hearing, I would ask that you reach out to Scott and make arrangements to place additional funds into our firm's 
trust account. 

I and/or Scott would be happy to answer any additional questions you may have. What we are trying to avoid is 
any problems like we collectively had last time as it was certainly uncomfortable for both you and for us. 

I know your cases seem never ending and this must frustrate you. But as you are aware these people keep 
getting big paydays so they are relentless in continuing to pursue you. You are a big juicy target to them. So we 
need to fight them and get them to back off. 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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