
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Epstein 
Date: Mon, 22 Aug 2011 18:21:12 +0000 

> 

is it ok to pay attached invoice of $1,479.50? 
if so i will have jack send funds as we have done in the past 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-4811 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 

On Aug 22, 2011, at 9:40 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

 Forwarded message   
From: William Riley <I 
Date: Mon, Aug 22, 2011 at 3:28 PM 
Subject: FW: Epstein 
To: Darren indyke 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

barren, 

We still have not been paid yet. Thanks for checking on it. 

Bill Riley 

RILEY KIRALY 

Cell 

305.825 1101 - Fax 

954.905 4922 - Personal Fax 

EFTA00917438



This message (and any associated files) is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information that is 
confidential, subject to the attorney/client privilege or any other privilege afforded it under applicable slate and/or federal law. If you are not the intended recipient 
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, copying or distribution of this message. or Ides associated with this message, is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this message in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. Information contained in this email 
may have been obtained through a third party source. We do not guarantee the accuracy or usefulness of such information. Furthermore, we expressly disclaim 
any lability associated with the information provided by any third party sources. 

From: William Riley 
Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2011 12:47 PM 
To: Darren Indyke; Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: FW: Epstein 

As attached. As you can see I sent it to you on June 14 

Bill Riley 

RILEY KIRALY 

Cell 

305.825.1101 - Fax 

954.905.4922 - Personal Fax 

This message (and any associated files) is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information that is 
confidenfial, subject to the attorney/client privilege or any other privilege afforded it under applicable state and/or federal law. If you are not the intended recipient 
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, copying or distribution of this message, or files associated with this message, is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this message in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. Information contained in this email 
may have been obtained through a third party source. We do not guarantee the accuracy or usefulness of such information. Furthermore, we expressly disclaim 
any lability associated with the information provided by any third party sources. 

From: William Riley 
Sent: Tuesday, June 14, 2011 3:52 PM 
To: 'Darren Indyke' 
Cc: 'Jeffrey Epstein' 
Subject: Epstein 

Darren, 

Attached is our most recent billing in this matter. 

EFTA00917439



Bill Riley 

RILEY KIRALY 

- Cell 

305.825 1101 - Fax 

954.905 4922 - Personal Fax 

This message (and any associated files) is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information that is 
confidential, subject to the attorney/client privilege or any other privilege afforded it under applicable slate and/or federal law. If you are not the intended recipient 
you are hereby notified that any dissemination. copying or distribution of this message, or ides associated with this message, is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this message in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. Information contained in this email 
may have been obtained through a third party source. We do not guarantee the accuracy or usefulness of such information. Furthermore, we expressly disclaim 
any liability associated with the information provided by any third party sources. 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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