
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Outstanding invoices post July 5th 
Date: Fri, 16 Sep 2011 17:50:24 +0000 

yes , and be very very tough, 

On Fri, Sep 16, 2011 at 1:36 PM, Richard Kahn
should i call her to review her findings or wait 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York. NY 10065 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Lilly Ann Sanchez < 
Date: September 16, 2011 12:57:25 PM EDT 
To: "i  h" 
<jeevacation@gmail.com>
Cc: "CHRISTOPHER E. KNIGHT" < 
Subject: Re: Outstanding invoices post July 5th 

> wrote: 

, leevacation@gmail.com-

I have gone thru the invoices again and I believe that the "not to exceed" was in fact exceeded by approximately $20,000-
- not the figure stated below. 
I am willing to go line by line with richard again. 
Please advise if you want to do this and if so, when available. 

From: Richard Kahn < 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationegmail.com>
Cc: CHRISTOPHER E. KNIGHT; Lilly Ann Sanchez 
Sent: Thu Sep 15 13:20:50 2011 
Subject: Outstanding invoices post July 5th 

Jeffrey, 

Lilly and I just spent 45 minutes reviewing all outstanding invoices post July 5th for all matters. 
On the July & August 2011 invoices for matter 80743 we went line by line with my codings regarding the 
over billing on the amended claim. 
The amount that I thought was over billed of 54,255 was incorrect as the revised amount that Lilly agrees 
with is 39,993.75. 
I was very disappointed with the accuracy of their billing. 

I have attached a revised post July 5th outstanding balance reflecting the 100,000 paid this morning which 
shows 54,177.74 due on all post July 5th matters. 
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Lilly mentioned that time from September 1 - September 15 still needs to be billed for matters relating to 
punitive damages, summary judgement 
and motion to dismiss. 

Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 

lit 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: September 15, 2011 1:53:57 PM EDT 
To:
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
Reply-To: 

**TAX MATTERS- IRS Circular 230 Disclosure: To ensure compliance with requirements imposed by the 
IRS, we inform you that any tax advice contained in this communication (including attachments) was not 
intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding penalties under the Internal 
Revenue Code or (ii) promoting, marketing or recommending to another party any transaction or matter 
addressed herein. If you would like such advice, please contact us.*** ***Attention: The information 
contained in this E-mail message is attorney privileged and confidential information intended only for the use 
of the individual(s) named above. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copy of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this communication in error, please contact the sender by reply E-mail and destroy all copies of the 
original message. Thank you. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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