
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: 

Date: Fri, 21 Oct 2011 19:10:42 +0000 

hbrk 

On Fri, Oct 21, 2011 at 2:39 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
I just met with Jean Luc 
He said he wants to begin paying for his expenses 
He said he can pay from his company or personally 1500 per month and then reconcile difference at end of 
year 
Who should I have him reimburse HBRK, NES, ? 
Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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