
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Bella Klein 

Cc: 
Subject: Re: Dr. Magnani 

Date: Thu, 10 Nov 2011 23:08:22 +0000 

ok 

On Thu, Nov 10, 2011 at 10:13 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Attached please find Dr. Magnani invoice for 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: November 10, 2011 3:56:36 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
Reply-To: 

n the amount of $657. Please approve for payment. 
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