
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jemaeationggmail.com,

To: Steve Susman 

Cc: Darren Indyke = 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Thu, 08 Dec 2011 16:56:50 +0000 

not only did i think i was ahead„ but would have thought that as you decided to bow out and send me a 
nastigram abdicating any responsbility whatsoever for what happened in the future. 

On Thu, Dec A, 2011 at 12:39 PM, Steve Susrnan > wrote: 

Harry has been trying to contact Darren about the 
$223k you currently owe us. Apparently we have 
heard nothing--not as to when it will be paid or 
whether you intend to pay it. You have never 
complained about the bill and have always been 
extremely complimentary of the commitment we 
gave to your case and the quality of our work. I 
think that after all the hard work we did for you 
(on an hourly basis because you wanted it that 
way), you would treat us with greater courtesy. I 
also thought we would be friends for life, and that 
at least, I could use you and Darren for 
references. I still hope so. 

Please give me a call so we can discuss this. I 
don't want to have to initiate arbitration to collect 
our fee, but our partners are pressing us to do so 
unless we are promptly paid, or at least given a 
good reason not to. 
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Steve Susman 
560 Lexington Avenue, 15th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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