
From: 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: Peggy 

Date: Mon, 19 Dec 2011 15:16:43 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Fyi 
 Original Message 
From: Marisa Frank 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: RE: Peggy 
Sent: Dec 19, 2011 10:08 AM 

Dear Richard, 

This was just brought to my attention. 
I am not sure why this bill went to you. Please disregard it. The 
screening was coordinated with the Weinstein Company and the bill should 
have gone directly to them. I will reach out to Core Club and deal 
directly. 
I am so sorry for this inconvenience. I will speak with Core and address 
the problem. 

Best, 
Marisa 

 Original Message 
From: Allison Reddington 

 Original Message 
From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, December 16, 2011 9:56 AM 
To: Allison Reddington 
Subject: re: Peggy 

> I just received an invoice from Core Club in the amount of 3,126.94 It 

> appears to be a party hosted by Peggy Siegel on 11/28 for 70 covers 
> JEE and i do not no anything about this?? 
> Please advise 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA00926067



Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

EFTA00926068


