
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

To: Bella Klein

Subject: Re: Payment for Surgery 

Date: Tue, 20 Dec 2011 16:21:21 +0000 

pay the full amount 

On Tue, Dec 20, 2011 at 9:58 AM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Here is the clarification of the required payment. I pointed out the $15,000 special cost. Would you like me to 
pay the full amount or $15,000 only. 
Please advise as the operation is today in the morning. 
Thank you 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Allison Reddington < 
Date: December 20, 2011 9:46:05 AM EST 
To: Bella Klein < 
Cc: 
Subject: RE: Payment for Surgery 

Hello Bella, 

Below is the breakdown of the payments for 

Checks need to be made for nurses: 
Nursing: $2,275.00 

The cost to be paid to Dr office is $23,500 

surgery: 

$412 must also be aid to Dr. for photography. His number is and email 

Again, l can send a messenger to pick up the checks for the nurses today. 

Allison 

From: Bella Klein [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 20, 2011 9:33 AM 
To: Allison Reddington 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Payment for Surgery 

Alison, mentioned to Jeffrey that she has a special deal with Dr 
make a check to his name? 
Thank you, 
Bella 

for $15,000. Should i 
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On Dec 20, 2011, at 8:16 AM, wrote: 

=1, I love you! 

Could we send a messenger/intern to pick up the checks for the nurses this morning? 

Let me know if you need emails/numbers for 

Thanks again! 
Allison 
Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

From: 
Date: Tue, 20 Dec 2011 08:12:33 -0500 
To: Allison Reddington 
Cc: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Payment lar Surgery 

C 

Allison, Bella will surgery invoice his morning! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 19, 2011, at 6:17 PM, "Allison Reddington"

Hello 

wrote: 

Thanks so much for looking into the payment situation, I really do appreciate it. I know they had wanted 
everything paid for and checks delivered tomorrow. 

Thanks again for your help. 

Allison 

From: [rnailto: 
Sent: Monday, December 19, 2011 6:07 PM 
To: Allison Reddington 
Subject: Re: Payment for Surgery 

Hi Allison. I am back now! Ha a great time. Let me check in to this and will get back to you. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 19, 2011, at 5:24 PM, "Allison Reddington" < wrote: 

Hello 

I am so sorry to bother you 

Richard has not paid the bills for surgery and I cannot reach him. 

Can you please call or email him or let me know the best way to contact him? 
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Best, 
Allison Reddington 

Siegal Com an 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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