
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn • 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Fri, 30 Dec 2011 15:32:08 +0000 

call me 

On Fri, Dec 30, 2011 at 10:22 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
correct she waited until Oct 20th to send her september time 
i read the trail of emails and also my summary (see attached) which i believe they received and it made no 
mention of paying old mj time (61k) and old DK and olivaria time (pre july 5th) 
we paid off this summary the 100k and 140k and they misapplied funds: (it clearly stated that all outstanding 
we were paying on were for post July 5th matters) 
when we paid the 140k it included extra funds for Sep billing since Lilly was crying about the September 
billing which she took 30 days to send.. 

Richard Kahn 
I-IBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax
cel 

On Dec 29, 2011, at 6:11 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

review the email where lilly says she will get the sept bill shortly„ is she now saying that she never got it. 
and waited until oct 20 to send it. ? 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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