
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Ivjet

Subject: Fwd: 
Date: Wed, 13 Dec 2017 16:31:52 +0000 

Inline-Images: image004.jpg; image005.jpg; image006.jpg 

 Forwarded message  
From: Eric Roth  
Date: Wed, Dec 13, 2017 at 11:13 AM 
Subject: RE: 
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@grtn> 

Estimated at $65,000 ( including the cabin management switches which could run as much ad1,700 PER switch). 

Happy Channukah! 

Best Regards, 

Eric 

ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

Logo - Horizontal-SMALL 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport. Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com
Sent: Wednesday, December 13, 2017 11:10 AM 
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To: Eric Roth < 
Subject: 

> 

to replate all in the 550 , budget? 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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