
From: brice gordon • 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Pool refurbishment 

Date: Tue, 31 Jan 2012 19:13:18 +0000 

will halt work, it would be best that Darren speak to Rex and nut out new agreement and schedule 

On Tue, Jan 31, 2012 at 3:04 PM, brice gordon • 
if this what you wish then it will happen 
we forward revised timeline, this will include main hose pool. 

wrote: 

On Tue, Jan 31, 2012 at 2:42 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
and we all decidedd over and over again that it NEEDED TO be taken down to guknite 

On Tue, Jan 31, 2012 at 12:20 PM, brice gordon  > wrote: 
Tom and I based the scope of the work on the agreement that was forwarded to us, which is attached 
The procedure and finish was based on install instruction from southern grout the supplier of the material 
that is stipulated in agreement. 
I have spoken to Al @Southern Grout just to confirm that this the correct procedure for re 
plastering a pool of this age. 
He confirmed manufactures recommendation 
To change of scope, then a new agreement would need to be reached, taking note timeline would change 
as well. 
It was always my understanding from conversation with Gary that to plaster, Flag pool would cost 10k, 

On Tue, Jan 31, 2012 at 10:31 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 
i understand but that is 
NOT what we agreed was the way to go.. that is resurfacig of a pool„ this is not that . we are paying 
for a redo not a resurfave if you recall he said the it woud cost him 6k to resurface. 

On Tue, Jan 31, 2012 at 9:19 AM, BMG < wrote: 
This is the manufactures recommended procedure for resurfacing of a diamond brite pool 
Tom recommends that we follow this procedure 
We have have recourse of they screw it up again 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 31, 2012, at 9:57 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

we specifillcaly said that the plaster was not to be resurfaced but replayed„ both gary rex and i 
agreed. i m not sure why you are sending me this, 

On Tue, Jan 31, 2012 at 8:50 AM, brice gordon < wrote: 
please note attached, paragraphs 2a and 2b from install info for diamond brite pools resurfacing 
projects, also spec sheets from Southern Grouts and motars, inc 
http://sgm.cc/pdf/InfoSheets/Diamond_Brite_web.pdf

EFTA00928817



the preparation of the main house pool will require that the diamond brite be totally removed so 
the 1 x 1 tile can be adhered properly 
Flag pool, heater relocation this week, Material is due to arrive STT, tomorrow, Saturday for 
resurfacing. refill saturday and sunday 
Main pool, heater done and running, materials ordered, expect everything to be on sight by the 
20th Feb, empty the night of the 12th FEB to commence roughing out, 3 to 4 weeks for 
completion. 

On Mon, Jan 30, 2012 at 5:44 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
please makde sure that the flagpole pool is being entireily taken down tothe gunite the pattern 
of chipping looks as if they are going to try to bond a new finish to the old pool„ THAT is not 
acceptable 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 
Little Saint James 
USVI 
Phone: 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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Little Saint James 
USVI 
Phone: 
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Little Saint James 
USVI 
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Phone: 

BActa 
Little Saint James 
LJSVI 
Phone: 
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