
From: Richard Kahn

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Southern Financial LLC 15,000,000 withdrawal from Boothbay Absolute Return Strategies, LP 

Date: Wed, 13 Dec 2017 19:20:37 +0000 

never heard back from Ari... 
does that mean our 15mm withdrawal is as of 12-31-2017 and we will be paid in January 2018? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

On Nov 14, 2017, at 5:38 PM, Ari Glass < wrote: 

Richard 
Traveling 
I'll call you tomorrow 
This will need some modification 

Ari Glass 
BoothBay Management 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 14, 2017, at 4:14 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

in reference to attached Southern Financial LLC 15,000,000 withdrawal from Boothbay Absolute Return 
Strategies, LP we would like to postpone our redemption from December 31, 2017 to January 31, 2018 
we are aware that our capital will be subject to the regular risk and reward of its share of fund performance 
for the entire month of January 2018. we expect our 15,000,000 to be paid in full by February 28, 2018 
thank you and please call me with any questions 

<doc02217820170823151818.pdf> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments may be legally privileged, proprietary and/or 
confidential. If you are not an intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, copying, disclosure or 
distribution of all or any portion of this e-mail and any attachments is strictly prohibited. If you received this e-
mail in error, please notify the sender, permanently delete the e-mail and any attachments, and destroy all hard 
copies immediately. This communication should not be regarded as an offer, solicitation or recommendation to 
sell or purchase any security or other financial product. Boothbay and its related entities reserve the right to 
monitor and/or save all e-mail communications through their networks. 
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