From: jeffrey epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com>

To: Richard Kahn <[ -
Subject: Re: George Delson
Date: Fri, 02 Mar 2012 20:55:40 +0000

Mo

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my 1Phone

On Mar 2, 2012, at 2:23 PM. Richard Kahn *’_?* wrote:

Larry Delson called me yesterday and told me he was going to send his monthly retainer in the amount of
$10,000 for March 2012,

In 2012 we have paid 20,000 (jan & feb). If we are going to switch accountants soon then my concern 1s that
20,000 (or 30,000 1f we pay March) is very expensive to file 20 extensions & prepare 15 1099's which were
done in January 2012,

Larry also mentioned that vou and him were going to get together on yvour next visit to NY.
I am sure Larry is also going to ask about 60,000 that George was requesting.

Please advise 1f 1 should pay March retainer in the amount of 10,000,

Richard Kahn

HBRK Assaociates Inc.

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F
New York, NY 10065

tel 646-862-4811

fax 646-350-0954

cell 917-414-7584

Begin forwarded message:

From:
Date: March 2, 2012 2:01:02 PM EST
To:

Subject: Message from KMBT C253
Reply-To: _
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