
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Sean 
Date: Thu, 01 Mar 2012 15:10:28 +0000 

remind me on monday„ and we will include in georges expenses for the 76 

On Thu, Mar 1, 2012 at 5:53 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
i wanted to confirm that you approved both outstanding invoices totaling $30,786.54 

a) April 30, 2009 - $13,957.79 (advertising & marketing of 5-76 serial # 760667 
b) July I, 2011 - $16,828.75 (advertising & marketing of 727) 

Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 

From: Lvjet < > 
Date: February 29, 2012 7:36:40 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: Fwd: Sean 

Rich, 
je approved payment of Sean's invoice to Bristol 
thx, see below 

—Original Message--
From: jeffre e stein <eevacation©gmail.com>
To: lvjet 
Sent: Wed, Feb 29, 2012 7:32 pm 
Subject Re: Sean 

Yes Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone On Feb 29, 2012, at 7:42 AM, 

wrote: > Jeffrey, > Sean just emailed me, he heard we are in prebuy on GIV,. > May I have your 

approval to pay his invoice? > > Would like his help, even if we abandon this purchase to look at 

other potential GIV's to compare. Sean may be a good asset to negotiate on our behalf regarding 

the headliner issue,. I hope to have numbers for you later today LAX time. > Thx > Larry > > > 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
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