
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Bella Klein

Subject: Re: Dr Magnani 
Date: Thu, 26 Apr 2012 16:27:47 +0000 

Yes 

On Thu, Apr 26, 2012 at 11:34 AM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 
Attached please find invoice from Dr Magnani for Irina in the amount of $400. She had a procedure on April 
18th. Please advise. 
Thank you 

Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: April 26, 2012 11:11:19 AM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
Reply-To: 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00934295


