From: Richard Kahn <||}}

To: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=
cc: Craig Martin <} | NG
Subject: FW: Kerri Holmes Invoice #3
Date: Tue, 22 May 2012 23:41:38 +0000
Attachments: TWA Kerri CK_051612 1694.pdf

This is additional invoice Brice approved today
| have not yet reviewed nor has Larry

From: Monique Harry <~

Date: Tue, 22 May 2012 16:39:23 -0400

To: Richard Kahn <R
ce: Jeannic < >, Una Pascol <

Subject: Kerri Holmes Invoice #3
Rich,

Attached for payment via Check Kerri Holmes invoice #3 in the amount of $1,694.00. Additional painting at West Hanger.

MONIQUE HARRY
Project Administrator

LSJ, LLC

6100 Red Hook Qtr Suite B3
St. Thomas, USVI 00802
Telephone

EFTA00935130



