
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: 

Subject: Re: Bell 430 
Date: Tue, 22 May 2012 02:18:02 +0000 

pay it 

On Tue, May 22, 2012 at 4:16 AM, < > wrote: 
Jeffrey, 
I spoke with Darren tonight and he brings up a point regarding the additional middle seat in fwd divan. 
Gary told Darren the Toy store wants the final 25% payment before they will release the helicopter, the approval for 
middle seat belt for fwd facing divan most likely will not be received when interior is completed. If the Toy store does this 
modification in a way that approval is not received, we would have paid in full for interior in order to put helicopter in 
service. 
Do you want Darren to include verbiage for your protection? or other option is delay acceptance until all approvals are 
obtained for your protection, Gary indicated to Darren they will not release the helicopter if we hold the final 25 % 
payment to the Toy Store, 
pls advise, no work will be completed until contract is signed and deposit is received at the Toy store,. 

Darren, please correct me if I'm wrong in my statement? 

thank you 
Larry 
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