
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Shaher 

Subject: Re: Lord Macdonald's trip to Paris 
Date: Wed, 06 Jun 2012 20:42:55 +0000 

i talked to him „ he said rough sex cases , not unusual, autopsy would be a factor but not a big one. drugs are 
not a defense , he thought he woudl get bail . reduced charge. , and would not exagerate his potential 
strengths. he held the positon of head of prosecutions, the exact same portion that he would be dealing with.. 
norway has put pressure on the govt. . I think you should focus on what punsihment woudl be acceptable.. 
time , spent„ ? maybe a form of house arrest? , work charity, the high profile nature is a problem.. the press 
will highlight any issues. 

On Wed, Jun 6, 2012 at 4:34 PM, Shaher > wrote: 
From his C V he seems well positioned with vast experience ,if he manages to undo the tangled web of issues 
then I will stamp that he is a direct descendent of yakoub like you and me „, 
How you enjoying the caribian 

Sent from my iPad 

On 6 Jun 2012, at 19:46, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

do you think he is really jewish? 

On Wed, Jun 6, 2012 at 12:35 PM, Shaher < > wrote: 
For your eyes sir 

Sent from my iPad 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Paul Venables <PaulVenables@matrixlaw.co.uk>
Date: 6 June 2012 14:06:36 GMT+03:00 
To:' '
Cc: 1PracticeStaff TeamT <PracticeStaff_TeamT@matrixlaw.co.uk>, Ken Macdonald 
<KenMacdonald‘matrixlaw.co.uk> 
Subject: Lord Macdonald's trip to Paris 

Dear Sir 

I hope you are very well today. 

I understand that you would like to organise a meeting with Lord Macdonald in Paris soon so you can 
discuss some legal issues with him. The best day in the near future would be 20th June. 
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Lord Macdonald's fee for preparation for and attendance at a meeting in Paris would be £20000 sterling, 
plus VAT if applicable, plus first-class travel expenses [we would also require Counsel's hotel 
accommodation to be paid separately, if the need to make an overnight stay in Paris should arise]. 

We would require receipt of the agreed funds by Friday 15th June. I can provide you with Matrix 
Chambers' bank details so that payment for Counsel's work can be made electronically. 

I would be grateful if you could confirm that the quoted fee is agreeable to you, and that you can pay in 
advance by the 15th June. Once we have confirmation, I shall liaise with you to finalise timing, venue etc. 

We very much look forward to assisting you. I attach Lord Macdonald's CV for your reference. 

Yours ever 

Paul Venables 

******************************* ****** ******* *************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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