
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Apple Quotation for HBRK Associates Inc. - Jeffrey Epstein : 
Date: Wed, 27 Dec 2017 11:02:08 +0000 

yes to all 

On Wed, Dec 27, 2017 at 5:47 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
Just received notification that 4 of Apple iMacs will arrive early Jan 4/5 at 71st. 
Below is James plan on setups and deployment. Not sure your thoughts on network backup drives. 
Please advise. Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue,  4th Floor 
New York,  NY 10022 
Tel 
Fax 
Cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: james I personal genius
Date: December 24, 2017 at 3:59:42 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Re: Apple Quotation for HBRK Associates Inc. - Jeffrey Epstein : 

Sorry for the delay, it's good to be busy but prioritizing can be challenging. I'll do billing next week, we went through 
the 20 hours for this month and then some. 

I did follow up with Elina like JEE asked, but it had nothing to do with the PB computer update. She was having 
problems Skyping with the boss from her flat here... she stopped responding without a real resolution, so I'll ping her 
again to see if she still needs help. 

Did the 2 AT&T iPhones that were still at the house get returned? I forgot to look when I was last there. 

Summary 
like to order 6 Network Backup Drives, and 5 Shipping boxes. The Network drives would come to NY and ship 

out with the new computers. A box would be shipped to the locations where the old computers are (explanation 
below). 

Links 
6 of WD 8TB My Cloud Network Backup Drives A $319.99 each 

5 of OWC Shipping Safe Box For Apple 2013 and later 27" iMac Models @ $70 ea. 
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Explanation 
A. Network Backup Drives. 
At 71st we have a Time Capsule that the laptop and iMac backup to (it's almost full), but we have NO backups of any 
of the other machines. If we did, we could have avoided the whole Palm Beach iMac disaster by shipping up a small 
backup drive instead of a full iMac. 

This iMac Pro upgrade is a rare opportunity to easily deploy these across the other houses. I can set them up here, 
configure the new machines to look for them then the house managers just need to plug them into their main network 
switch with the cables we send with them. Everything happens automatically, nothing to configure or screw up. When 
the next massive upgrade comes, these drives can be sent to me instead of the full computers. 

B. Shipping Boxes. 
When I thought through the math of it, my original suggestion has the iMac Pro shipping boxes each taking 4 trips 
back and forth, and I worry that's asking too much of them, that they get dinged up too much on trips I, 2 and 3 and 
don't provide adequate protection when we send the iMac Pros out to their final homes. 

These boxes can be shipped directly to each location by OWC, for the house managers to pack up the old computers. 
The boxes are designed specifically for the machines they're packing, so there's no risk of damage from improper 
packing. They can either be loaded onto the plane or shipped to us. We'll only use the iMac Pro boxes for 2 trips —
from apple to NY, & from NY to their final destinations. 

$70 each (free shipping to most locations) is a bargain compared to the hassle of damage claims, and IM spend half 
of that shipping the empty iMac Pro boxes to the houses anyway. 

Question: Where are these going? assuming: 
1 for 71st, 6th floor 
1 for Palm Beach 
1 for Zorro 
1 for Paris 
1 for LSJ 
Where's #6 go? 

Thank you, 

James Ce 
your Personal Genius 
0 Certified Support Professional 10.6 
hapacianalgoiusa 

On Dec 20, 2017, at 10:16 AM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

ok 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 
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On Dec 20, 2017, at 10:01 AM, james I personal genius < 

Quote is correct. 

I'll email later today with deployment recommendations. 

Thank you, 

James Ce 
your Personal Genius 

Certified Support Professional 10.6 
http://personalgenius.co

On Dec 20, 2017, at 6:14 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 

please reconfirm revised quote and i will order today 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue,  4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

> wrote: 

From: UES Business < 
Subject: Re: Apple Quotation for HBRK Associates Inc. - Jeffrey Epstein : 
Date: December 19, 2017 at 12:51:09 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Rich Kahn >, james ce I personal genius 

Dear Richard, 

Good afternoon. I've attached the updated quote for you and James to review. Feel free to call me with cc 
payment details so that I can submit the order to the processing team. 

<HBRK Associates Quote 12.19.17.pdf> 

All the best. 
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Mark 

Mark Brophy 
Business Expert 
Apple Upper East Side 
Phone (646) 343-2703 

On Dec 19, 2017, at 10:15 AM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 

can you please revise attached order to total quantity of 6 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY  10022 
tel 
fa 
cel 

On Dec 14, 2017, at 3:31 PM, Apple Business Team < 

Quote: 

18000000679072 

Prepared for. 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. - Jeffrey 

Epstein 

575 LEXINGTON AVE 4 FL 

NEW YORK NY 10022-6146 

12129711306 

Customer ID: 23002023373700 

> wrote: 

Date: Valid until: 
Thursday, December 14, 2017 Saturday, January 13, 2018 

Ship to: 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc.- Jeffrey 

Epstein 

9 East 71st Street 

NEW YORK NY 10021 

12129711306 

<92ddc1ee9a96449f945f09dbcb6f5412.png> 

Product / Description Qty 

Prepared by: 

Mark Brophy 

Apple Business Team 

Price Total 

27-inch iMac Pro with Retina 5K display $10,921.00 
ZOUR 
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Configuration: 
3.0GHz 10-core Intel Xeon W processor, Turbo 
Boost up to 4.5GHz 
128GB 2666MHz DDR4 ECC memory 
aTii SSD 

• Radeon Pro Vega 64 with I 6GB of HBM2 memory 
• Magic Mouse 2 + Magic Trackpad 2 Space Grey 
• NONE 
• NONE 

Int English Magic Keyboard with Numeric Keypad 
with English Print • Space Grey 

AppleCare+ for iMac 1 5144.00 $144.00 
S6126LL/A 

Subtotal S1 1,065.00 

Estimated Tax 5982.02 

Estimated Total (USD) $12,047.02 

Additional Notes 

Dear Richard. Good afternoon and thank you for your email. Per your request, I've attached a quote for Mr. 
Epstein based upon the specs you noted and the new ship to address. (81W is there a Suite• Floor or 
Apartment # we need to note?) I have also added Loyalty Pricing to the quote as well. If everything looks 
good then I can take cc payment details from you via telephone and submit the order to our processing 
team to ship to the 71st Street location. I look forward to your reply. Al the best, Mark 

Delivery Expectations 

Your product(s) will ship as they become available. All shipments subject to unexpected carrier delays. 

Terms and Conditions 

This is a quote invoice, not a receipt of purchase. The applicable sales tax and any additional surcharges 
(such as recycling fees) are subject to verification and will be reflected on your final invoice. 

Product availability and pricing are subject to change without notification. The configurations and pricing 
noted in this quote are generally valid for up to 30 days, and are specifically intended for purchase by the 
entity indicated above. Quotes that reflect promotional or special sales event discounts are valid only for 
the duration of the promotion or special sales event. 

Consideration for business pricing is made based on the type of product, the quantity and the availability 
of the products ordered. For further information regarding this proposal, please contact your Apple 
Business Team. Our full sales and refund terms and conditions can be found 
at 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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