
From: 
To: "Je vacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: Korean air 
Date: Wed, 27 Jun 2012 17:41:16 +0000 

Importance: Normal 
Attachments: $6.4MM_LOIfor Purchase_from_Korean_Air_Co..doc 

Jeffrey, 
Here is Darren's LOI with offer 6.4M and his personal disclaimer notes,. 
If this acceptable to you, Do you approve for me to sign? 
Thank you, 
Larry 
Here is revised LOI. I am in the middle of something for JE, so you need to send this to JE with a note that he 
should know that it provides for: 

$6.4 MM purchase price 
refundable $100K deposit 
Deadline for Seller to accept is Friday, June 29 at 5PM. If accepted, DKI to provide draft Purchase agreement by 
7 business days after Seller's acceptance of LOI and mutually signed agreement by 15 business days after seller's 
acceptance of LOI. 
Nothing in the LOI that specifically states who pays to move the aircraft for the inspection. If he wants this 
negotiated in advance of agreement on price, it has not been done. He should know that. 
Nothing in the LOI about the aircraft being delivered with a US C of A, only that it is airworthy and in the 
condition required under the Purchase Agreement 
The loi is subject to the execution of a definitive purchase agreement. 

Please review LOI yourself first. I want to make sure two sets of eyes have reviewed this. Thanks. 

PLEASE NOTE THAT, EFFECTIVE JUNE 5, 2012, MY NEW CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS 
FOLLOWS: 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE. PLLC 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T Original Message From: Darren Indyke Date: Wed, 27 Jun 2012 11:51:21 
To: Subject: Re: Korean air Here is revised LOI. I am in the middle of something for JE, so you need to send this 
to JE with a note that he should know that it provides for: $6.4 MM purchase price refundable $100K deposit 
Deadline for Seller to accept is Friday, June 29 at 5PM. If accepted, DKI to provide draft Purchase agreement by 
7 business days after Seller's acceptance of LOI and mutually signed agreement by 15 business days after seller's 
acceptance of LOI. Nothing in the LOI that specifically states who pays to move the aircraft for the inspection. If 
he wants this negotiated in advance of agreement on price, it has not been done. He should know that. Nothing in 
the LOI about the aircraft being delivered with a US C of A, only that it is airworthy and in the condition 
required under the Purchase Agreement The loi is subject to the execution of a definitive purchase agreement. 
Please review LOI yourself first. I want to make sure two sets of eyes have reviewed this. Thanks. PLEASE 
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NOTE THAT, EFFECTIVE JUNE 5, 2012, MY NEW CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS FOLLOWS: DARREN 
K. INDYKE DARREN K. INDYKE PLL 575 Lexin ton Avenue 4th Fl r New York, New York 10022 
Telephone mail: 

**** The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, and is 
intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If 
you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - 
2011 Darren K. Indyke, PLLC A All rights reserved. 

 On Jun 27, 2012, at 11:06 AM, wrote: > Darren, here is your previous offer on Korean Air 
GIV, if you want to insert 6.4M, > Thx > Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T > From: "Fred Wagner" > Date: Wed, 27 
Jun 2012 09:52:26 -0500 > To: > Subject: RE: Korean air > > L > > Here is the offer ou sent last time. > > 
Best Re ards > > Fred Wa er > Office 

> > From: tt [mailto: > Sent: Wednesday, June 27, 2012 7:00 AM > To: 
Fred Wagner > Subject: Re: Korean air > > Hi fred, > What was our last offer to purchase GIV? > Price I mean > 
Thx > Larry > Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T > From: "Fred Wagner" > Date: Tue, 26 Jun 2012 08:00:34 -0500 
> To: > Cc: > Subject: Re: Korean air > > Larry > > Spoke with JY last night. He told me that someone was 
supposed to view the airplane last week who made acceptable offer but did not show up...ut was a broker but he 
didnt give me name. He said they are very close to listing with Gulfstream it another major broker. > > He 
suggests you submit your price but do it quickly. > > Fred Wagner > Cell: 1-214-679-7291 > > Sent from my 
Motorola ATRIX. 4G on AT&T > > > ---Original message > From: > To: Fred Wagner > 
Cc: Chuck Hallett > Sent: Wed, Jun 20, 2012 01:44:13 GMT+00:00 > Subject: Korean air > > Hi Fred, > Any 
update regarding GIV? > My boss was asking if Gulfstream got exclusive? > Can you call them and tell them we 

' > Thx > Larry Visoski > 917-868-6145 > Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T > 
.pdf> 

* * * *** * * ** * * ** * * * it * * ** * ** ilk * * * ** * * * * *** * * * * *** * * * * *44 * * * * ** * ilk * * ilk * * * ilk * * ilk * ** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —All rights reserved. 
***44***44**44***i4**i4***if**i4***i4**i4**444**i4**444**i4**i*4**i4**i4***i4**i4***i4**if***if

On Jun 27, 2012, at 11:06 AM, wrote: 

Darren, here is your previous offer on Korean Air GIV, if you want to insert 6.4M, 
Thx 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: "Fred Wagner" < 
Date: Wed 27 Jun 2012 09:52:26 -0500 
To: 
Subject: RE: Korean air 

Larry: 

Here is the offer you sent last time. 
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Best Regards 

Fred Wagner 
Office: 
Cell: 
Fax: 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, June 27, 2012 7:00 AM 
To: Fred Wagner 
Subject: Re: Korean air 

Hi Fred, 
What was our last offer to purchase GIV? 
Price I mean 
Thx 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: "Fred Wagner"< 
Date: Tue, 26 Jun 2012 08:00:34 -0500 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Korean air 

Larry 

Spoke with JY last night. He told me that someone was supposed to view the airplane last week who 
made acceptable offer but did not show up...ut was a broker but he didnt give me name. He said 
they are very close to listing with Gulfstream it another major broker. 

He suggests you submit your price but do it quickly. 

Fred Wa ner 
Cell: 

Sent from my Motorola ATRIXT" 4G on AT&T 

 Orioinal messao  
From: 
To: Fred Wagner < 
Cc: Chuck Hallett < 
Sent: Wed, Jun 20, 2012 01:44:13 GMT+00:00 
Subject: Korean air 

> 

Hi Fred, 
Any update regarding GIV? 
My boss was asking if Gulfstream got exclusive? 
Can you call them and tell them we have interest still. 
Thx 
Larry Visoski 
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Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
< .pdf> 
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