
From: Eileen Alexanderson
To: mjeevacation@gmail.comm <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Mon, 09 Jul 2012 15:27:21 +0000 

This is a very, very valid issue. Seems like this should have been explored earlier in the planning process. I reached out to 
John Suydam this morn and will be meeting to talk through the subject sometime in the next day or two. Thanks. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [rnalltoleevacatIon@gmall.00m] 
Sent: Sunday, July 08, 2012 08:09 PM 
To: Eileen Alexanderson; Melanie Spinella 
Subject: 

i think you should also check the gaming commission reports to see if there is any mention of a transfer of leons 
interest. his children clearly should have had a disclosable financial interest if the transfer had been properly 
done.. I fear that govt , and commission filings will back up the irs likely view that no transfer actually took 
place previously, uh oh. 
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