
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 28 Nov 2017 18:45:49 +0000 

I cannot repay her. I don't think she should pay for me and I don't understand why has to help me 
financially and not you.. 

I giomo Tue, Nov 28, 2017 alle 6:21 PM jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> ha scritto: 
Take it 

On Tue, Nov 28 2017 at 1:09 PM > wrote: 
Jeffrey, ME was very kind and told me that if I needed help she could give me 2k for this month. I'm not 
sure if I should accept because I cannot promise to give her the money back and the situation that she has to 
pay for me makes me a bit uncomfortable... 
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