
From: Richard Kahn • 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Amy 

Date: Mon, 20 Nov 2017 22:33:26 +0000 

i called amy earlier and she was out in field and had not yet read attached 
i scheduled a call with Amy myself and darren for tomorrow 930am EST 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Nov 20, 2017, at 2:12 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

amy, there appears to be a great deal of issues. environmental etc. 
 Forwarded message 
From: Erika Kellerhals  
Date: Mon, Nov 20, 2017 at 2:05 PM 
Subject: FW: Attached Image 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation ail.com>, Amy Dempsey
Cc: Darren Indyke 

CZM called and asked us to pick up the attached letter today re: dock permits. They have determined the 
application is incomplete. 

I can handle the legal items noted in the letter. 

Amy if like to discuss let me know. 

Erika A. Kellerhals 
Member 
Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC 
Royal Palm Professional Building 
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email: 

Notice: This communication may contain privileged or other confidential information. If you are not the 
intended recipient, or believe that you have received this communication in error, please do not print, copy, re-
transmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Also, please indicate to the sender that you have 
received this e-mail in error, and delete the copy you received. Thank you. 

On 11/20/17, 3:10 PM, ' < 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
<3521_001.pdf> 

wrote: 
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