
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: update 
Date: Fri, 14 Dec 2012 19:44:05 +0000 

Dec I5-jan 15 paid now 

On Friday, December 14, 2012, Richard Kahn wrote: 
Please confirm that $4,000 is approved for Christina for period Nov 15 - Dec 15 from Enhanced 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: December 14, 2012 2:20:53 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: update 
Reply-To: 

Hi Rich, 

I had a good meeting with Jeffrey today. He is okay with my being paid for December 15th. And will decide on a 2nd 
month with Reputation after he has a conference with them on Monday. I am waiting to finalize the time on Monday. 

Thank you for wiring $4,000 to my bank of America account for Dec 15th. I will be in touch on Monday after the 
conference. 

Hope  are well. 

cell: 
email: 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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