
From: Richard Kahn • 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: PBI Mac 

Date: Fri, 17 Nov 2017 18:41:55 +0000 

disappointing that dave sees something and makes no mention.. 

larry contacted meridian and i sent receipt today for Mac that cost 3,500 as we are hoping for 100% 
reimbursement.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fa 
cel 

On Nov 14, 2017, at 5:42 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

 Forwarded message 
From: 
Date: Tue, Nov 14, 2017 at 4:53 PM 
Subject: Re: (no subject) 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 

Want me to contact Meridian and let them know? 

In a message dated 11/14/2017 4:52:24 M. Eastern Standard Time, jeevacation@gmail.com writes: 

broke the computer 

On Tue, Nov 14, 2017 at 4:38 PM, c>  wrote: 
Yes, the big box was dropped at Meridian when line service was lifting the box to the baggage compartment. 

In a message dated 11/14/2017 3:44:15 M. Eastern Standard Time, jeevacation@gmail.com writes: 

dave did somoen drop the computer box when loading it in plane. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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