
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: lia l <a> 
Subject: Send the following 

Date: Sat, 26 Jan 2013 17:39:20 +0000 

He will pay 58 * with your terms , if you want more -than. Terms will need adjustment , deposit amount .costs' 
walk away terms inspection issues etc . I think 5.8 is right and can be done 

On Saturday, January 26, 2013, wrote: 
Update from Dennis,. 
See below,. 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Dennis Andersen <1 
Date: Sat, 26 Jan 2013 10:47:46 -0600 
To: 
Subject: RE: 1085 contract 

Larry, 

Were there any changes besides the price? Instead of going back and forth, 6.2 is what he will take for the aircraft. If 
Jeffrey is willing to pay that amount please revise the agreement, sign and send back. 

I'm in Omaha until 3;30est and then in Houston for a few days if you want to discuss. 

Best Regards, 

Dennis Andersen 

President 

Florida Jet Sales, Inc. 

1516 Perimeter Road, Suite 201 

Palm Beach International Airport 

West Palm Beach, FL 33406 

Office: 

Fax 

EFTA00952754



Cell: 

www.FlaJet.com 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, January 25, 2013 5:55 PM 
To: Dennis Andersen 
Subject: 1085 contract 

Dennis, 

pls find attached signed contract.. 

thank you. 

Larry 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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