From: Eileen Alexanderson <] | AR
To: " -::\:cation@gmail com>
Subject: Re:
Date: Thu, 07 Feb 2013 23:37:12 +0000

Yes, in good shape but not finished, have been crazy busy with other things but will try to finish up tomorrow. After
speaking to Alan had to go back to the Apollo people for more of the support for the numbers they supplied. Working on
the presentation of the numbers. | went from one meeting to another this afternoon and am now on the train home. Just

checked my voicemail and have a message from Carlyn to call her. Have you been speaking to her?

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, February 07, 2013 02:45 PM Eastern Standard Time
To: Eileen Alexanderson

Subject:
have we started the accoting for the overpayments
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential
and intended solely for the person or entity to whom they are
addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged
material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or

other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon this
information by persons or entities other than the intended
recipient is prohibited. If you have received thiz email in
errar please contact the =zender and delete the material from
any computer.
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