From: [N I -
To: Richard Kahn <
Ce: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationf@gmail.com=>, brice - _

Subject: Re: LSJ LISTON 021113 $1.400.00
Date: Wed, 20 Feb 2013 13:23:41 +0000

Good Morning Rich,

Jermaine, did ask Danny to install the antenna, which was on site 1/15/13, but Danny required a location

and the range of the unit, these guestions were never answered, as Jermaine did not know. Only when Liston was
on site were these guestions answered.

The only piece of equipment that Danny was asked to install was the antenna, which he could not do without the
ahove guestions being answered.

Hoping this answers vour concerns

Warmest regards

On Tue, Feb 19, 2013 at 7:02 PM, Richard Kahn :i_'-'-* wrote:

[ am told that Danny was asked to do this installation by Jermaine numerous times but was to busy therefore
we hired Liston

Please advise

Thank you

Richard Kahn
IBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th |

On Feb 12, 2013, at 3:46 PM., LS]J wrote:

Good afternoon Jermaine

Thanks for clarification

[ will attach vou info to check request
Thanks again

Warmest regards

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 12, 2013, at 12:26 PM, "Jermaine Ruan" <] - ' o'c:

Good morning [

EFTA00954138



JE gave a verbal directive on the 12/24/12 at FTC to get the cell repeater. Danny couldn’t complete the mounting of
the antenna. Therefore on 1/25/13 | got the verbal from JE to proceed with a sub-contractor to mount the cell
repeater along with the termination of the fiber blue beach. JE also sent me an email on the 1/29/13 asking where
was the repeater to be mounted.

The "testing” is for the wiring to verify negative line loss.

The configuration of "Surecell” Radio was done in accordance with “Surecell” specifications. The manufacture sent a
piece of equipment that does not work and will be returned to the manufacturer. Liston Networks is consulting with
a former AT&T Technician to verify. If this effort fails the unit will be returned to “"SureCell”.

Regards

JRuan

From: I I (cveitco:

Sent: Monday, February 11, 2013 5:46 PM
To: Jermaine Ruan
Subject: LS)_LISTON_021113_%1,400.00

Hi Jermaine,

In reference to Liston Network Systems for the billing of mounting cell antennas, do vou have any backup
noting JE approval? Also noting they said they tested equipment, not quite correct since there was no power
at that point

Can vou fill in the blanks as I will be asked

Thanks

Warmest regards

L5J,LLC

Island Manager

6100 ERed Hook Quarters Suite B3
St Thomas

EFTA00954139
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