
From: - - 
To: 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Sun, 10 Feb 2013 22:56:43 +0000 

no just hers 

On Sun, Feb 10, 2013 at 6:56 PM, > wrote: 
For both tickets ? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 10, 2013, at 5:54 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

we pay„ he has no money 

On Sun, Feb 10, 2013 at 6:49 PM, 1.==.11.1101111a> wrote: 
INIMIM, he doesn't care with or without her . Up to you 

Sent from my iPhone 
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