From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: American Yacht Harbor office rent
Date: Thu, 16 Nov 2017 17:55:19 +0000
Attachments: STC Credit Card Charges 11.14.17.pdf;
STC AYH CC6406 11.14.17 $10,428.41 Inv. 8021733 .pdf;

STC AYH CCo406 11.14.17 $9.724.23 Inv. 8021519.pdf:
STC AYH CCo6406 11.14.17 $10,986.79 Inv. 8021400.pdf

please advise on the following:
a) pay nothing and wait..
b) pay all months outstanding (sep, oct & nov totaling 31,149)

¢) pay november only (10,428)

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Ine.

e

Begin forwarded message:

From: Una Pascal </ -

Subject: American Yacht Harbor
Date: November 16, 2017 at 8:02:07 AM EST

To: Rich <[ -

Good Morning Rich,

Please review the attach invoices and approve for credit card payment.
AmericanYach Habor

September Billing  10,986.79

October Billing 972423

MNovember Billing 10,428 .41

Thanks,
Una

EFTA00955653



EFTA00955654



