
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Marty 
Date: Thu, 16 Nov 2017 18:54:24 +0000 

Attachments: Invoice_Nov_6,_2017.doc 

outstanding invoices are as follows: 

sep 32,110 
oct 14,333 

total 46,443 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Martin G. Weinberg" C 
Subject: CONFIDENTIAL 
Date: November 16, 2017 at 1:52:03 PM EST 
To: 

Richard, can you get approval for payment on Sept invoice (dated 10-3) which constitutes the largest part of the Oct 
invoice (dated 11-6), thanks. Marty 
Martin G Weinberg PC 
20 Park Plaza 
Suite 1000 
Boston, MA 02116 

Virus-free. 

EFTA00955730


